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Why won’t God reveal his special will for my life already?

Because he doesn’t intend to... So says Kevin DeYoung in this punchy book about making decisions the
godly way.

Many of us are listening for the still small voice to tell us what’s next instead of listening to the clear voice in
Scripture telling us what’s now. God does have a will for your life, but it is the same as everyone else’s: Seek
first the kingdom of God. And quit floundering. 

With pastoral wisdom and tasteful wit, DeYoung debunks unbiblical ways of understanding God’s will and
constructs a simple but biblical alternative: live like Christ. He exposes the frustrations of our waiting games
and unfolds the freedom of finding God’s will in Scripture and then simply doing it. 

This book is a call to put down our Magic 8-Balls and pick up God’s Word. It’s a call to get wisdom, follow
Christ, be holy, and live freely. To just do something.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Smith:

The publication with title Just Do Something: A Liberating Approach to Finding God's Will has lot of
information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new
information the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world now. That is
important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you within new
era of the globalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you
want.

Ellen Wirth:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not seeking Just Do Something: A Liberating
Approach to Finding God's Will that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied through reading this
book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world considerably better
then how they react toward the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading habit only for the geeky
man or woman but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for every you who want to start
looking at as your good habit, it is possible to pick Just Do Something: A Liberating Approach to Finding
God's Will become your own starter.

Dolly Taylor:

As we know that book is important thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This book Just Do Something: A Liberating Approach to Finding God's Will was filled
in relation to science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your technology competence.
Some people has various feel when they reading the book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you
can really feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you
simply wanted.

Carol Williams:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen want book to know the update information of year to help year. As we know those guides
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. With
the book Just Do Something: A Liberating Approach to Finding God's Will we can acquire more advantage.
Don't you to be creative people? For being creative person must love to read a book. Simply choose the best
book that suited with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this time book Just Do
Something: A Liberating Approach to Finding God's Will. You can more inviting than now.
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