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Ten-year-old Sugar lives on the River Road sugar plantation along the banks of the Mississippi. Slavery is
over, but laboring in the fields all day doesn't make her feel very free. Thankfully, Sugar has a knack for
finding her own fun, especially when she joins forces with forbidden friend Billy, the white plantation
owner's son.

Sugar has always yearned to learn more about the world, and she sees her chance when Chinese workers are
brought in to help harvest the cane. The older River Road folks feel threatened, but Sugar is fascinated. As
she befriends young Beau and elder Master Liu, they introduce her to the traditions of their culture, and she,
in turn, shares the ways of plantation life. Sugar soon realizes that she must be the one to bridge the cultural
gap and bring the community together. Here is a story of unlikely friendships and how they can change our
lives forever.

From Jewell Parker Rhodes, the author of Ninth Ward (a Coretta Scott King Honor Book and a Today show
Al's Book Club for Kids pick), here's another tale of a strong, spirited young girl who rises beyond her
circumstances and inspires others to work toward a brighter future.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Grove:

This Sugar are usually reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The reason
why of this Sugar can be one of several great books you must have is giving you more than just simple
reading food but feed an individual with information that might be will shock your preceding knowledge.
This book is actually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and
printed types. Beside that this Sugar forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that could it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Shannon Grant:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their own reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve
their expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is this
Sugar.

Betty Young:

This Sugar is fresh way for you who has curiosity to look for some information given it relief your hunger
details. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having bit of digest in
reading this Sugar can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this specific book is easy
to get by means of anyone. These books develop itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, that's why I
mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy
this guide is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book variety for your
better life and also knowledge.

Bruce Healy:

Reserve is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen need book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those textbooks have many
advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. From the book
Sugar we can acquire more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To become creative person
must like to read a book. Only choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't become doubt to
change your life at this time book Sugar. You can more attractive than now.
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