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The riveting new novel from the #1 New York Times bestselling author of The Liar.
 
“She stood in the deep, dark woods, breath shallow and cold prickling over her skin despite the hot, heavy
air. She took a step back, then two, as the urge to run fell over her.”
 
Naomi Bowes lost her innocence the night she followed her father into the woods. In freeing the girl trapped
in the root cellar, Naomi revealed the horrible extent of her father’s crimes and made him infamous. No
matter how close she gets to happiness, she can’t outrun the sins of Thomas David Bowes.
 
Now a successful photographer living under the name Naomi Carson, she has found a place that calls to her,
a rambling old house in need of repair, thousands of miles away from everything she’s ever known. Naomi
wants to embrace the solitude, but the kindly residents of Sunrise Cove keep forcing her to open
up—especially the determined Xander Keaton.
 
Naomi can feel her defenses failing, and knows that the connection her new life offers is something she’s
always secretly craved. But the sins of her father can become an obsession, and, as she’s learned time and
again, her past is never more than a nightmare away.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Rose Slagle:

The book The Obsession gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make
your capable more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting pressure or having big
problem with your subject. If you can make examining a book The Obsession to be your habit, you can get a
lot more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects.
You may know everything if you like open and read a publication The Obsession. Kinds of book are several.
It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Paul Howell:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read a new book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the whole day to
reading a reserve. The book The Obsession it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to
develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book out of your
smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high quality.

Alta Favors:

Why? Because this The Obsession is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap
it but latter it will distress you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic
author who all write the book in such awesome way makes the content inside easier to understand,
entertaining means but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this
any more or you going to regret it. This unique book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book
include such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking method. So , still want to hold up
having that book? If I have been you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Jason Valladares:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but also novel and The Obsession or perhaps others sources
were given understanding for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more
and more. Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping
them to include their knowledge. In various other case, beside science guide, any other book likes The
Obsession to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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