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NORA ROBERTS' 200th BOOK!

In her stunning new novel, #1 New York Times bestselling author Nora Roberts proves why no one is
better “when it comes to flawlessly fusing high-stakes suspense with red-hot romance" (Booklist,
starred review).

Daughter of a cold, controlling mother and an anonymous donor, studious, obedient Elizabeth Fitch finally
let loose one night, drinking too much at a nightclub and allowing a strange man’s seductive Russian accent
to lure her to a house on Lake Shore Drive.

Twelve years later, the woman now known as Abigail Lowery lives alone on the outskirts of a small town in
the Ozarks. A freelance security systems designer, her own protection is supplemented by a fierce dog and an
assortment of firearms. She keeps to herself, saying little, revealing nothing. Unfortunately, that seems to be
the quickest way to get attention in a tiny southern town.

The mystery of Abigail Lowery and her sharp mind, secretive nature and unromantic viewpoint intrigues
local police chief Brooks Gleason, on both a personal and professional level. And while he suspects that
Abigail needs protection from something, Gleason is accustomed to two-bit troublemakers, not the powerful
and dangerous men who are about to have him in their sights.

And Abigail Lowery, who has built a life based on security and self-control, is at risk of losing both.
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From reader reviews:

Bonnie Mentzer:

The book The Witness make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable
considerably more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem with the subject. If you can make looking at a book The Witness for being your habit, you can get
considerably more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about several or all
subjects. You can know everything if you like start and read a guide The Witness. Kinds of book are a lot of.
It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this publication?

Brian Street:

Now a day people that Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each info they get. How many people to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Witness book because
book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred % guarantees there
is no doubt in it you may already know.

Sharon Hite:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you go through a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, because
book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book that you
have read. In order to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The The Witness
provide you with a new experience in reading through a book.

Dennis Jenkins:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know
those textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. From the book The Witness we can take more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people?
For being creative person must prefer to read a book. Simply choose the best book that appropriate with your
aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life at this book The Witness. You can more pleasing than now.
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