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The only thing extroverted Nate loves more than baseball is his quiet, reserved Casey. The feeling's mutual,
thanks--but it isn't all fun and games. A wedding planner, Casey's booked solid during the summer months
and thanks to a certain poem about the Mudville Nine, cringes at the thought of ball games. Fair's fair--with
seven older sisters who redefined “wedding drama”, Nate freezes at the thought of tying the knot. Casey
might wish things were different, but he wouldn't trade Nate, his big heart, or his skills between the sheets
for a wedding worthy of a Rockefeller.

After losing a strip poker bet, Casey's promised forfeit is spending a full day at a softball tournament. He's
sure there's more going on than a simple sports wager and wonders what Nate's up to, but he's curious
enough to jump in and commit. And so, finally, is Nate, who's planning a surprise involving an engagement
ring and a proposal from the pitcher's mound.

But things don't go quite according to scheme for the odd couple when Nate takes his lover out to the ball
game. And who knows what might happen when Casey's called up to bat?
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From reader reviews:

Helen Sullivan:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for a while
is reading. That's why, by reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure
than other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this Mighty Casey
book as nice and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Tia Sargent:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they
will get large amount of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have extra
time, we will say absolutely yes. People is human not just a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of
activity are there when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the actual
book you have read is definitely Mighty Casey.

Michelle Shaw:

The book untitled Mighty Casey contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea with easy
method. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read
that. The book was authored by famous author. The author will take you in the new time of literary works. It
is possible to read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the
book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site
and order it. Have a nice read.

Chrissy Stallings:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book
that recommended for your requirements is Mighty Casey this book consist a lot of the information with the
condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how can the world has grown up. The
words styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some investigation when
he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.
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